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AZRIELI MASTERS COURSE DESCRIPTIONS 
 

CORE COURSES 
 
EDU 5000 LEARNING AND COGNITION 3 credits 

 

This course examines student thinking and learning through the perspectives of cognitive and learning 
science. It includes an introduction to cognitive science focusing on representations used to model student 
knowledge and thinking, and how these can be used to describe student learning over the short- and long-
term. Finally, the course will focus on how these representations of knowledge and learning can enhance 
teaching practice in classroom settings. 
 
EDU 5010 EDUCATIONAL PSYCHOLOGY AND JEWISH LEARNING       3 credits 

 

Note: This is a pre-requisite course required of all students who have not taken any psychology 
courses before joining Azrieli. Credits in this course do not count towards the 36-credit Azrieli 
course requirements.  
 
Basic concepts in educational psychology are presented with particular attention to theory, research and 
practical applications for the educator. A wide range of topics related to the application of psychology to the 
classroom include a review of the psychology of motivation, instilling values, and the role of educators in 
promoting a healthy self-concept. A basic overview of the major theories of child development is provided in 
the context of recent research findings, Judaic perspectives, and implications for educators working in Jewish 
schools.  
 
EDU 5070 PROMOTING JEWISH VALUES          3 credits 

 

In this course, a practical approach is taken to the field of moral development, values education and the 
psychology of religion, informed both by psychological theory and Jewish thought. The major focus of the 
course is on practical educational applications of the fields of positive psychology and social emotional 
learning. Specific topics in values education and religious education are presented in the context of recent 
research findings, Judaic perspectives, and implications for educators working in Jewish schools. In addition 
to 
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EDU 6319 TEACHING MIDRASH    3 credits 

 

The objective of this course is to acquire a knowledge of midrashic literature and its uses in Jewish education. 
Knowledge includes distinguishing between different midrashic genres (halakhic and aggadic) and between 
Midrash and talmudic Aggadeta. Attention is also paid to the historical provenance of significant midrashic 
collections, such as Midrash Rabbah, Lekah Tov and Midrash HaGadol. Uses in Jewish education include 
the incorporation of midrashic sources in biblical commentaries and the use of midrashim, in general, for the 
development of student character and values education. 
 

EDU 5220 TEACHING JEWISH HISTORY 3 credits 
 

This course addresses the means, methods, goals and objectives of teaching Jewish History in formal and 
informal Jewish educational settings. 
 

EDU 5225 SPIRITUALITY AND TEXTS 3 credits 
 

This course is about advancing spiritual objectives through the study and teaching of Jewish texts. The 
course covers defining and assessing spirituality, close reading and interpretation of Jewish texts, deriving 
spiritual values from Jewish texts, and teaching students to derive spiritual values from Jewish texts. 
 
EDU 5230 TEACHING TEFILAH 3 credits 

 

This course addresses principles, techniques, and materials for teaching tefilah in Jewish day schools; 
resource materials, terminology, concepts, curriculum, and philosophy of Jewish prayer. 
 
 
EDU 5240 TEACHING THE HOLOCAUST 3 credits 

 

This course provides principles, practices, materials, interdisciplinary activities, and resources, with 
particular emphasis on literature and film, for teaching about the Holocaust in elementary and secondary 
schools. 

EDU 5250 WORKSHOP IN INFORMAL JEWISH EDUCATION 3 credits 
 

This course will examine the underlying theories and methodologies, as well as practical application, of 
informal Jewish educational principles and techniques, including psycho-educational perspectives 
underlying informal education, and student-centered active learning processes. Effective communication, 
drama, film and other multi- media procedures and programming materials will be considered, along with 
leadership training and halachik dimensions of outreach work. 
 
EDU 5260 TEACHING JEWISH STUDIES: TORAH SHE BA�AL PEH 3 credits 

 

This course focuses on the teaching of Torah She Ba'al Peh on the secondary level. It will include: an 
historical overview of the role and nature of Torah She Ba'al Peh studies; the place it has within the 
curriculum; an examination of the structure of the Midrash, Halakha, Mishna and Talmud; strategies for the 
teaching of texts and sugyot; contemporary Yeshiva approaches to Torah She Ba'al Peh studies; use of 
technology; chevruta learning; engaging the student; creative thinking and analysis; motivational techniques; 
logical thinking; teaching the challenged and areas often neglected. 
 
EDU 5317 TEACHING ISRAEL AND ZIONISM 3 credits 

 

Curricular and instructional development in religious Zionism and modern Israel, including multi- and inter- 
disciplinary approaches; studying current events and promoting Israel advocacy; integration of Israel 



AZRIELI GRADUATE SCHOOL OF JEWISH EDUCATION & ADMINISTRATION 

WWW.YU.EDU/AZRIELI 

 

 

 
EDU 5325   ART AND PRACTICE OF ADULT JEWISH EDUCATION  3 credits 

 

Participants will study classical theories of adult learning and apply them to instruction. Central theorists, 
notions of transformation and their application to the Jewish classroom will be considered. Students will 
study techniques for enhancing adults’ learning - the management of difficult students and other challenges. 
Developmentally appropriate topic choices, approaches and evaluation of adult learning will be included. 
Will include some study and teaching of Jewish texts. 
 

EDU 9000  Section AZ  Independent Study   
 

By special arrangement with a faculty member only. 
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AZRIELI DOCTORAL COURSE DESCRIPTIONS 
 
EDU 8000 THEORIES OF LEARNING AND TEACHING 3 credits 
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EDU 8330 VALUES & MORAL DEVELOPMENT 3 credits 
 

The course will review current psychological thinking about the development and education of values and 
morality in children and adolescents. This will include a psychologically informed and evidence based 
examination of strategies for instilling values in areas such as sexuality, materialism, respect, responsibility, 
self-control, anger management, and gratitude. Each of these categories will be examined through the 
prism of current psychological theory, Jewish thought, and model education strategies. 
 
 
EDU 8340 PSYCHO-SOCIAL PROBLEMS IN THE JEWISH COMMUNITY 3 credits 

 

Processes and problems involving the personal development and attitudinal changes of Jewish youth in 
American society. Topics will include “at-risk” behavior, media (television, internet) exposure, and 
relationships between learning and behavior. 

 
 
EDU 8400 INTRO TO RESEARCH IN EDUCATION 3 credits 

 

This doctoral level course introduces students to the discipline of empirical educational research, preparing 
them to be responsible consumers and producers of knowledge. Topics include the scientific method, 
research paradigms and data collection methods, study designs, conceptual frameworks and literature 
reviews, ethics, and APA style. 
 
EDU 8410 RESEARCH IN JEWISH EDUCATION (QUANTITATIVE) 3 credits 

 

Introduction to various quantitative research designs and methods and the statistical analyses associated 
with each. Students gain the skills to read and conduct quantitative research studies, as well as to 
statistically analyze data through the use of computer software. 
 

 
EDU 8420 RESEARCH IN JEWISH EDUCATION (QUALITATIVE) 3 credits 

 

The goal of this course is to prepare doctoral students to be critical consumers of the qualitative educational 
research literature, a crucial stepping-stone to developing their own dissertations. This will include a review 
of interviewing techniques and semi-structured interviewing; observation techniques, ranging from 
participant observation to experimental phenomenology; surveys, focus groups -sei5.47 0 Td
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EDU 8820 SUPERVISION IN JEWISH SCHOOLS 3 credits 

 

This course will cover instructional supervision; staff development/in-service training; action research; 
instructional leadership and establishing professional culture of reflective practice among teachers; peer 
supervision and mentoring of co-
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